
Bid No. 19-157 - Ready Mix Concrete

All bids are subject to correction after bids have been completely reviewed.
Bidder Descrip.  Unit Price Bidder Descrip.  Unit Price 

5 sacks/c.y.  $                         85.00 5 sacks/c.y.  $                           84.00 
5.5 sacks/c.y.  $                         87.00 5.5 sacks/c.y.  $                           86.00 
6 sacks/c.y.  $                         89.00 6 sacks/c.y.  $                           88.00 
6.5 sacks/c.y.  $92.00                    

(EMPC 4K @ $94.80 
c.y.) 

6.5 sacks/c.y.  $                           96.00 

7 sacks/c.y.  $                         95.00 7 sacks/c.y.  $                           95.00 
7.25 sacks/c.y. high early  $                         96.50 7.25 sack/c.y. high early  No Bid 

10.5 sacks/c.y. MoDOT 5Hr Set  $                      135.00 10.5 sacks/c.y. MoDOT 5Hr Set  $                        119.50 

1% calcium chloride, add  $                           2.00 1% calcium chloride, add  $                             2.00 
2% calcium chloride, add  $                           4.00 2% calcium chloride, add  No Bid 
Heated concrete, add  $                           5.00 Heated concrete, add  $                             5.00 
Finish sand, add  $                           3.00 Meramec sand, add  $                             4.00 

Master builders HE122 
accelerator  $                           5.50 

Master builders HE122 
accelerator  $                             2.00 

Pozzutec 20# 1% (bid on GRT 
Superset 1%)  $                           3.00 

Pozzutec 20# 1% 
 $                             5.00 

Pozzutec 20# 2% (bid on GRT 
Superset 2%)  $                           6.00 

Pozzutec 20# 2%
 No Bid 

Pozzolith NC 534# 1% (bid on 
GRT Superset 1%)  $                           3.00 

Pozzolith NC 534# 1% 
 No Bid 

Pozzolith NC 524# 2% (bid on 
GRT Superset 2%)  $                           6.00 

Pozzolith NC 524# 2% 
 No Bid 

Minimum order quantity  4 Cubic Yards Minimum order quantity  2 Cubic Yards 

Cost for less than lot load
 $150.00 less than 2 yds. 
$110.00 less than 3 yds. 
$70.00 less than 4 yds. 

Cost for less than lot load
 2-2.75 c.y. $100.00                 
3-3.75 c.y. $75.00                           
4-4.75 c.y. $50.00                            

Waiting time
 $1.50 per min, per 

truck Waiting time
 $1.75 per min, per 

truck 

Bid Opening:  6/3/19 @ 2:00 p.m.

Kienstra                                                  
755 South New Ballas Rd.                 

Suite 150                                                        
St. Louis, MO 63141                                                                             
Tel: 314.994.1616                          
Fax: 314.994.1618

Schreiter Ready Mix                                                                                       
200 So. Cool Springs Rd.                                                                                                           

O'Fallon, MO 63366                                                                                
Tel: 636.240.2600                                               
Fax: 636.247.2647
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