
LINE QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL

1 1 LS

Design,Supply and Install  Diesel 

Powered Backup Generator 

(includes training/demonstration, 

warranty, and first year 

maintenance). 97,233.00$    97,233.00$   115,500.00$    115,500.00$ 43,391.25$    90,000.00$       0 88,602.00$       

2 1 LS

Removal and Disposas of existing 

Generator and Structure 9,000.00$      9,000.00$     10,000.00$      10,000.00$   5,000.00$      5,000.00$         1,800.00$         

Base Bid Total  (Sum of Items 1 

and 2)

3 1 LS

Desigh,Supply and Install Natural 

Gas Powered Backup Generator 

System (includes 

training/demonstration, warranty, 

and first year maintenance). In 

Lieu of Bid Item 1 148,233.00$  148,233.00$ no bid no bid 71,505.00$    119,413.00$     no bid no bid

4 1 LS

Removal and Disposas of existing 

Generator and Structure - In Lieu 

of Bid Item 2 9,000.00$      9,000.00$     -$               5,000.00$         -$                    Bid Alternate (A) Total  (Sum of 

Items 3 and 4) 157,233.00$                         

95,000.00$                                  

no bid

jeffoakley@visionmo.com

2162 Whiskey Creek Lane

Kris@reinholdelectric.com

Reinhold Electric, Inc

slayne@lcsconstruct.com

BID ALTERNATE (A)

636.916.0900

Jeff Oakley

Foristell, Mo.  63348

Mike Hauser

314.267.8570

BASE BID 

mikeh@HauserElectric.com

106,233.00$                         125,500.00$                            

BidTab: 17-190 Back Up Generator

Bid Opening:  September 29,2017 2:30 pm local time

        All quotes are subject to correction after bids have been completely reviewed.

St. Louis, Mo.  63125

314.631.1158/314.631.6750

Kris Schmittgens

Vision Electric & Systems

29 Lone Star Crt

O'Fallon, Mo.  63366

2511 Lemay Ferry Rd.

124,413.00$                                

Layneco Construction Services

1027 Cool Springs Industrial Dr.

O'Fallon, Mo.  63366

636.294.6245

Steve Layne

Hauser Electric

no bid

90,402.00$                                
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