
Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost

1
Remove and Dispose of Existing 50 Meter Pool Plaster 
Surface

1 LS $33,485.00 $33,485.00 $47,276.00 $47,276.00

2
Prepare and Install New Pebble FINA Pool Surface at 
50Meter Swimming Pool

1 LS $167,962.00 $167,962.00 $217,919.00 $217,919.00

3 Remove and Replace Main Pool Drains/Grates. 1 LS $8,415.00 $8,415.00 $10,332.00 $10,332.00

4
Prepare Tile Surface and Epoxy Grout 50 Meter Pool Deck 
Tile.

1 LS $14,350.00 $14,350.00 $14,351.00 $14,351.00

5

6 50 Meter Pool Bulkhead Removal and Reinstallation 1 EA $14,885.00 $14,885.00 $13,998.00 $13,998.00

7
Remove and Replace gutter grating and fasteners around 
the entire 50 Meter pool perimeter 

1 EA $24,058.00 $24,058.00 $19,766.00 $19,766.00

8
Prepare Tile Surface and Re-Grout Spa Tile Including the 
Horizontal Surfaces, 18-Inch Tall Outside Sides, Interior 
Bench, Floor and 4-Inch Back Splash.

1 LS $4,995.00 $4,995.00 $5,754.00 $5,754.00

9
Prepare Tile Surface and Re-Grout Leisure Pool Deck Tile 
and 13–Inch Sides.

1 LS $16,275.00 $16,275.00 $17,108.00 $17,108.00

10
Remove Stain and Scum Build Up and Clean 50 M Pool 
Tile Lane Indicator Lines (Floor And Walls). Remove 
Existing Grout Between Tiles and Epoxy Grout

1 LS $16,157.00 $16,157.00 $14,595.00 $14,595.00

11
Contractor Performed Startup and Maintance for New 
Pebble FINA Pool Surface at 50 Meter Swimming Pool

1 LS $3,995.00 $3,995.00 $4,114.00 $4,114.00

Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost

5A
Provide Complete Light Assemblies, Wiring, Lenses and 

All Other Components For New LED Pool Lights. 
(Materials Only – 50 Meter Pool) 

20 EA $2,440.00 $48,800.00 $1,984.00 $39,680.00

5B
Provide Complete Light Assemblies, Wiring, Lenses and 

All Other Components For New LED Pool Lights. 
(Materials Only – Leisure Pool) 

5 EA $2,440.00 $12,200.00 $1,984.00 $9,920.00

5C
Remove And Replace 50 Meter Pool and Leisure Pool 

Lights and Lenses And Necessary Wiring (Convert To LED)
25 EA $785.00 $19,625.00 $322.00 $8,050.00

Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost

12
Remove and Replace Spa Pumps, Filtration and Jet 

System
1 LS $33,190.00 $33,190.00 $20,232.00 $20,232.00

Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Cost Cost Unit Cost Cost

13
Contractor Invetigation and Design of 50 Meter Pool 

Movable Floor Decking
1 LS $8,969.00 $8,969.00 $8,368.00 $8,368.00

14
Contractor Removal and Replacment of 50 Meter Pool 

Movable Floor Decking per City Approved Design
1 LS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Alternate 3

Bid Alternate 3 Total  (Items 13-14) $8,969.00 $8,368.00
Grand Total (Items 1-14) $427,361.00 $451,463.00

20-137 - Rec-Plex 50 Meter Pool, Leisure Pool and Spa Refurbishment

Maryland Heights, MOEdwardsville, IL 62025

All Bids are subject to correction after bids have been completely reviewed

Westport Pools, Inc.
156 Weldon Parkway

Capri Pools & Aquatics
22 Gateway Commerce Center Dr

Bid Opening 10:00 AM - April 2, 2020

Bid Alternate 2

314-743-4816
cdepaul@westportpools.comdwiecher@capripool.com

314-351-6020

Bid Alternate 1 Total  (Items 5A-5C) $80,625.00 $57,650.00

Base Bid (Items 1-4, 6-11) $304,577.00 $365,213.00
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