
Bid No. 20-149 - Limestone Aggregate Materials

Bid Opening: 5/26/2020 @ 2:00 p.m. (Non-Public)
All bids are subject to correction after bids have been completely reviewed.

Fred Weber LaFarge Magruder Limestone Co. BMC Stone, LLC

2320 Creve Coeur Mill Rd.  14580 Missouri Bottom Rd 255 Watson Road 216 Hwy DD

Maryland Heights, Mo.  63043 Bridgeton, Mo. 63044 Troy, Mo 63379 Defiance, MO 63341

314.344.0070 314.739.0169 636.528.4180 636.798.2505

matbilling@fredweberinc.com sandy.petersen@lafargeholcim.com jfortner@magrudercompanies.com jillmundy@bmcstone.com
Item Descrip. Unit Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

1A
Minus/Down Stone:                                                         
1"  Furnished & Loaded in City Truck

TN $5.75 No Bid $4.50 $5.00

1B 2" Furnished & Loaded in City Truck TN $5.75 No Bid $4.50 $5.00

1C 3" Furnished & Loaded in City Truck TN  No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid

1D 4" Furnished & Loaded in City Truck TN $5.75 No Bid No Bid $6.00

1E 5" Furnished & Loaded in City Truck TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1F 6" Furnished & Loaded in City Truck TN $5.75 No Bid $4.50 No Bid
1G Delivery Charge TN $5.25 No Bid $7.50 Based on Location

2A
Clean Stone:                                                                  
3/4" Furnished & Loaded in City Truck

TN No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.25

2B 1" Furnished & Loaded in City Truck TN $10.75 No Bid $9.50 No Bid
2C 2" Furnished & Loaded in City Truck TN $9.50 No Bid $7.75 $10.00
2D 2" x 4" Furnished & Loaded in City Truck TN $9.50 No Bid $7.75 $10.00
2E 8" Furnished & Loaded in City Truck TN $16.00 No Bid No Bid $12.00
2F Delivery Charge TN $5.25 No Bid $7.50 Based on Location

3A
Revetment Stone/Rip-Rap: Furnished & Loaded in 
City Truck

TN $16.00 No Bid $18.00 $16.50

3B Delivery Charge TN $6.25 No Bid $8.00 Based on Location
4A River Sand: Furnished & Loaded in City Truck TN No Bid $12.75 No Bid No Bid
4B Delivery Charge TN No Bid $4.75 No Bid No Bid

5A
Fine Masonry Sand: Furnished & Loaded in City 
Truck

TN No Bid $12.85 No Bid No Bid

5B Delivery Charge TN No Bid $4.75 No Bid No Bid

6A
Golf Course Sand: Furnished & Loaded in City 
Truck

TN No Bid $35.65 No Bid No Bid

6B Delivery Charge TN No Bid $4.75 No Bid No Bid

7A
Golf Course Dry Fine Sand: Furnished & Loaded in 
City Truck

TN No Bid $33.40 No Bid No Bid

7B Delivery Charge TN No Bid $4.75 No Bid No Bid
8A Quarry Run: Furnished & Loaded in City Truck TN $5.75 No Bid $5.45 $6.00
8B Delivery Charge TN $6.25 No Bid $8.00 Based on Location

Additional 
Costs:

After Hours & Weekend Rates: HR  Quote per occurance  Case by case $200.00 per hour $300.00 per hour

HR  after 15 min. on job site $50.00  N/A $90.00 per hour $90.00 per hour

7:00 a.m. - 3:00 p.m. 7:00 a.m. - 3:00 p.m. 7:00 a.m. - 3:45 p.m. 6:00 a.m. - 3:15 p.m.
*All deliveries require 18 ton 

minimum

North Stone Bridgeton Foley Quarry Defiance
11900 Prichard Farm Rd. 14580 Mo. Bottom Rd. 399 Old Hwy 79 216 Hwy DD

Maryland Heights, MO 63043 Brideton, MO 63044 Foley, Mo 63347 Defiance, MO 63341

Locations where materials can be picked up:

Waiting Time (if delivered to jobsite)

Indicate Normal Loading Times M-F
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