
LINE QTY UNIT DESCRIPTION Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost

1 3 Ea. Recumbent Bike 2,795.00$                8,385.00$             2,275.00$           6,825.00$       2,361.21$           7,083.63$             2,549.77$          7,649.31$             
Manufacturer, Model

2 2 Ea. Upright Bike 2,595.00$                5,190.00$             2,025.00$           4,050.00$       2,058.18$           4,116.36$             2,247.62$          4,495.24$             
Manufacturer, Model

3 2 Ea. Stepmill 4,695.00$                9,390.00$             4,607.57$           9,215.14$             4,860.81$          9,721.62$             
Manufacturer, Model

4 1 Ea. Upper Body Cycle 2,395.00$                2,395.00$             3,301.53$           3,301.53$             3,301.53$          3,301.53$             
Manufacturer, Model

5 2 Ea. Stepper 3,495.00$                6,990.00$             2,442.54$           4,885.08$             2,611.11$          5,222.22$             
Manufacturer, Model

6 9 Ea. Elliptical 4,100.00$           36,900.00$    3,846.17$           34,615.53$           4,172.67$          37,554.03$          
Manufacturer, Model

7 2 Ea. Cross Trainer 3,500.00$           7,000.00$       4,662.68$           9,325.36$             4,985.00$          9,970.00$             
Manufacturer, Model

8 3 Ea. Rower 1,043.00$           3,129.00$             1,043.00$          3,129.00$             
Manufacturer, Model

9 1 Ea. Treadmill Climber 4,221.00$           4,221.00$             4,221.00$          4,221.00$             
Manufacturer, Model

32,350.00$           54,775.00$      79,892.63$           85,263.95$          

$1,950.00 5,850.00$             

Octane; Model: XT4700

Matrix; Model: A5X

Concept 2; Model: D W/PM5

Jacob's Ladder; Model: Original

True; Model: XCS900 Matrix; Model: A5X

Matrix; Model: R5X

Matrix; Model:U5X

Matrix; Model:C5X

Sports ART; Model: UB521M

Matrix; Model: S5X

(With 900 MegaHertz Features)

2nd Wind Exercise Equipment

3101 Bartold Ave.
St. Louis, MO 63143

636.399.9519
wboyle@2ndwindexercise.com

1211 Weaver Rd.

2nd Wind Exercise Equipment

3101 Bartold Ave.

 Orthotech Sports Medical Equipment, 
Inc. 

314.324.0765

Matrix; Model: R5X

Matrix; Model:U5X

(Without 900 MegaHertz Features)

St. Louis, MO 63143

wboyle@2ndwindexercise.com
636.399.9519

GRAND TOTAL

Startrac; Model: 8-RB LCD

Startrac; Model: 8-UB LCD

Stairmaster; Model: 8-Gauntlet LCD

Stairmaster;  Model: Airfit UBE

BidTab: 17-112 - Rec-Plex Cardio Equipmnet
Bid Opening:  Friday, December 9, 2016 @ 2:00 p.m.

All quotes are subject to correction after bids have been completely reviewed.

Herrin, IL 62948
618.616.1671

tomjohnston@orthotechsports.com

True Fitness

865 Hoff Road
O'Fallon, MO 63366

mahansen@truefitness.com

Stairmaster; Model: 8-Freeclimber LCD
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

True; Model: CS900R

True; Model: CS900U
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Matrix; Model:C5X

Sports ART; Model: UB521M

Matrix; Model: S5X

Concept 2; Model: D W/PM5

Jacob's Ladder; Model: Original

True; Model: Spectrum Octane; Model: XT4700

No Bid

No Bid

 Option B: Line Item 1: Recumbent Bike, 
Startrac; Model: SRBX 

$1,950.00 5,850.00$             

$1,750.00 3,500.00$             

1 9 Ea. Octane Pro3500XL 200.00$                -$                 -$                       -$                      
2 1 Ea. Pecor 556 EFX Elliptical 100.00$                -$                 -$                       -$                      
3 1 Ea. Concept 2 Rower 25.00$                   -$                 -$                       -$                      
4 1 Ea. Magnum Bike with Upper Body Ergometer -$                       -$                 -$                       -$                      
5 1 Ea. Tectrix Climbmax -$                       -$                 -$                       -$                      
6 1 Ea. TRUE Z8 Recumbent Bike -$                       250.00$          -$                       -$                      
7 1 Ea. TRUE Upright Bike -$                       250.00$          -$                       -$                      
8 3 Ea. Cybex Arc Trainer 100.00$                -$                 -$                       -$                      
9 2 Ea. Star Trac Recumbent Bike 100.00$                -$                 -$                       -$                      

10 1 Ea. Star Trac Stepper 50.00$                   -$                 -$                       -$                      
11 2 Ea. Star Trac Elliptical 100.00$                -$                 -$                       -$                      
12 1 Ea. Star Trac Upright Bike 100.00$                -$                 -$                       -$                      
13 1 Ea. Star Trac Treadmill 200.00$                -$                 -$                       -$                      
14 1 Ea. Cybex Eagle Lat Raise -$                       -$                 -$                       -$                      

975.00$                500.00$          -$                       -$                      GRAND TOTAL OF TRADE-INS

Yes
Yes

Yes
Yes

Yes
No

Any  Literature Attached to Bid?   Yes  or  NO   
Any  Warranty Information Attached to Bid?   Yes  or  NO   

  Bid Options (Trade-Ins)

 Option B: Line Item 2: Upright Bike, 
Startrac;   Model: S-UBX 

Yes
No


